
City of Sparta Chemical Bid Tab

May 26th  2022

for July 2022 - December 2022
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ITEM AULICK BRENNTAG
Univar 

Solutions
DYCHO

Citco 

Water

Liquid Fluoride/Gal.
No Bid $3.295/ gal

$4.5450/ 

gal

$4.00/ gal 

($0,40/lb) $4.36/ gal

Sodium Hypochlorite/Gal.
No Bid

July - Sept 

$2.07/ gal No Bid $2.76/ gal $2.90/ gal

Kemira PAX-XL8/lb.
No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.5% Fuel 

$0.434/ lb No Bid

Chlorine 150 lb cylinders/lb.
No Bid

July - Sept 

$4.00/ lb No Bid $1.78/ lb $1.62/ Lb

Sulfer Dioxide 150 lb cylinders/lb.
No Bid

July - Sept 

$4.00/ lb No Bid $1.78/ lb $1.62/lb

Superfloc C-1598/Gal. (Polymer)

No Bid $18.05/ gal $25.02/ gal $40.38/ gal

$43.64/ 

gal

Bioxide/Gal. (Calcium Nitrate) $2.91/ gal

No Bid No Bid $2.89/ gal $3.00/ gal

Sodium Hypochlorite/Gal.
No Bid

July - Sept 

$3.37/ gal $3.82/ gal $2.76/ gal $2.90/ gal

Calcium Hypochlorite/lb. 

(Chlorine) No Bid $2.25/ lb $3.22/ gal $2.69/lb $2.43/ gal

Muriatic Acid/lb.
No Bid $0.29/ lb No Bid $0.40/ lb $0,47/lb

Water Plant  

WasteWater Treatment Plant

YMCA 

Bid packets were sent to 11  vendors. "No Bids" were received from 7 

vendors.  Preliminary low bids are highlighted in yellow. Bids will be 

awarded after specs are approved by Plant operators.  


